
NOTES: 10 yard bins or more, totals based on 1 pick-up per month and 1 ton of waste per month. 

Description
Mid Valley
Disposal

Caglia
Environmental

Waste
Management

UOM Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

Public Works Roads Area 3
30 Yard Roll Off:
Haul Charge Each $180.00 $375.00 No Bid
Tonnage Fee Ton $45.00 $45.00 No Bid
96 Gallon Recycle Cart Monthly $15.00 No Bid No Bid

Totals: $240.00

Public Works Roads Area 5
30 Yard Roll Off:
Haul Charge Each $165.00 $205.00 No Bid
Tonnage Fee Ton $45.00 $45.00 No Bid
96 Gallon Recycle Cart Monthly $15.00 No Bid No Bid

Totals: $225.00

Public Works Roads Area 7
25 Yard Roll Off:
Haul Charge Each $145.00 $130.00 $305.00
Tonnage Fee Ton $45.00 $45.00 $46.00
96 Gallon Recycle Cart Monthly $15.00 No Bid $25.00

Totals: $205.00 $376.00

Public Works Roads Area 8
25 Yard Roll Off:
Haul Charge Each $155.00 $140.00 $195.00
Tonnage Fee Ton $45.00 $45.00 $46.00
96 Gallon Recycle Cart Monthly $15.00 No Bid $25.00

Totals: $215.00 $266.00

Public Works Roads Area 9
25 Yard Roll Off:
Haul Charge Each $160.00 $140.00 $180.00
Tonnage Fee Ton $45.00 $45.00 $46.00
96 Gallon Recycle Cart Monthly $15.00 No Bid $25.00

Totals: $220.00 $251.00

Sheriff-Coroner's Office
40 Yard Roll Off:
Haul Charge Each $135.00 $120.00 $260.00
Tonnage Fee Ton $45.00 $45.00 $46.00
14 Yard Roll Off:
Haul Charge Each $140.00 $175.00 $260.00
Tonnage Fee Ton $30.00 $65.00 $23.00
14 Yard Roll Off:
Haul Charge Each $140.00 $120.00 $260.00
Tonnage Fee Ton $30.00 $25.00 $0.00

Totals: $520.00 $550.00 $849.00

Sheriff-Coroner's Office Central Kitchen
30 Yard Roll Off:
Haul Charge Each $140.00 $140.00 $210.00
Tonnage Fee Ton $30.00 $20.00 $0.00
4 Yard Organic Bin (2 bins x 5 pick-up per week) Monthly $495.53 No Bid $1,050.00

Totals: $665.53 $1,260.00

Plaza Building
25 Yard Compactor - Recycle:
Haul Charge Each $145.00 $250.00 $230.00
Tonnage Fee Ton $0.00 $20.00 $0.00
6 Yard Solid Waste Bin Monthly $190.28 $242.75 $175.00

Totals: $335.28 $512.75 $405.00

Totals: $2,625.81 $1,062.75 $3,407.00
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