ORDINANCE NO. 2019-01

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING THE 2019 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE AND THE 2018
INTERNATIONAL FIRE CODE PRESCRIBING REGULATIONS GOVERNING
CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS TO LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE, HAZARDOUS
MATERIALS, OR EXPLOSION; AND ESTABLISHING A DIVISION OF FIRE
PREVENTION AND INVESTIGATION, PROVIDING OFFICERS THEREFORE, AND
DEFINING THEIR POWERS AND DUTIES.

Be it ordained by the North Central Fire Protection District finds as follows:

AN ORDINANCE OF THE BOARD OF THE
NORTH CENTRAL FIRE PROTECTION DISTRICT PROPOSED AND INITIATED BY
Fire Chief Timothy V. Henry

MOVED BY__ Mr. Nonini SECONDED BY__ Ms. Souza

The 2019 California Fire Code and 2018 International Fire Code as amended by the
North Central Fire Protection District are hereby adopted.

FIRE PREVENTION

Section
100 Adoption of the California Fire Code
1011 Title

109.%.2 Limits Established by Law
101.1.3 Responsibility for Enforcement

102.3 Change of Occupancy

102.6 Historic Buildings

102.13 Application of Performance Code for Buildings and Facilities
103.1 General

103.2 Appointment

103.3 Deputies

103.4 Liability

103.4.1 Legal Defense

104.3 Right of entry

104.3.1 Warrant

104.3.2 Inspection Frequency

104.4 Identification

105.6 ° Required Operational Permits

105.6.14 Exhibits, Trade Shows, and Special Events
105.6.16 Fire Hydrants

Page 1 of 30



105.6.32
105.7
105.7.1
105.7.16
108
108.6
109.2
109.4
110.3.1
110.4
112.4
1132
1141
202
304.4
304.5
304.6
307.1.1
3121
503.5
506
506.1

507.3
807.5.1.3
901 .6.3.2
903.1
903.1.2
903.3.1
903.3.1.1.3
903.3.1.1.4
903.4.3
903.6
912.2.3
10251
2401.1.2
28111
5602

5604
5704.3.5.1

Open Burning

Required Construction Permits

Automatic Fire Extinguishing Systems

LP-Gas

Maintenance

Overcrowding

Limitations on Authority

Cost Recovery

Service

Violation Penalties

Failure to Comply

Authority to Require Connection to Service Utilities
Fees for Fire Inspections

General Definitions

Recycling and Industrial Waste Handling Facilities
Dumping of Combustible Waste Material

Removal of Debris

Prohibited Open Burning

General

Required Gates or Barricades

Locked Premises Access

Where Required

Locks

Unauthorized Possession of Fire Department Bypass Key
Unauthorized Duplication of Fire Department Bypass Key
Penalties

Key Box Maintenance

Fire Flow

Wood Use in Group A-3 Places of Religious Worship
Problematic Systems

General

Determination of Building Area

Standards

Group R Mixed Occupancy Buildings

Joint Live Work Units Quarters

Floor Control Valves

Where Required in Existing Buildings and Structures
Address Identification

General

Location

Scope

Fireworks Ordinance

Prohibition of Explosives
Basement Storage

Page 2 of 30



6101.3 Construction Documents
B103.4 Additional Modifications.
C103.4 Additional Modifications.
8-103 Historic Buildings

ADMINISTRATION
SECTION 100 ADOPTION OF THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE.
Section 100 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

100 Adoption of the California Fire Code. The 2019 California Fire Code, as
promulgated by the California Building Standards Commission, which incorporates the
adoption of the 2018 edition of the International Fire Code as amended with necessary
California amendments, and the 2018 International Fire Code, including Appendix
Chapters E and F, and the 2018 International Performance Code for Buildings and
Facilities Part | and Part Il are hereby adopted and amended by the North Central Fire
Protection District for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing conditions
hazardous to life and property, protection from fire, hazardous materials, or explosions,
except such portions as fully as if set out at length herein. The Board does hereby find it
is reasonably necessary to make certain changes and modifications to the requirements
contained in the rules and regulations adopted pursuant to Sections 17922 et seq. and
18935 et seq. of the California Health and Safety Code; such change or modifications are
herein more particularly set forth.

SECTION 101 SCOPE AND GENERAL REQUIREMENTS
SECTION 101.1. TITLE.
Section 101.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

101.1 Title. This code shall be known as the North Central Fire Protection District Fire
Code, may be cited as such, and shall be referred to herein as "this Code." When used
here, "CFC" means the 2019 California Fire Code, with such amendments as adopted by
the State of California and the 2018 International Fire Code, including appendix Chapters
E and F, as adopted and amended in this article.

SECTION 101.1.2 LIMITS ESTABLISHED BY LAW.
101.1.2 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

101.1.2 Limits Established by Law. The limits referred to in Sections 5704.2, 6104.2 and
Chapter 56 of the California Fire Code shall mean those locations noted by fire department

policy.

Page 3 of 30



SECTION 101.1.3 RESPONSIBILITY FOR ENFORCEMENT.
101.1.3 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

101.1.3 Responsibility for Enforcement. Enforcement of building standards and fire
protection requirements adopted by the State Fire Marshal and published in the California
Building Standards Code relating to fire and panic safety, and other regulations of the State
Fire Marshal, shall be the responsibility of the fire code official. This shall include R-3
occupancies, including one and two family dwellings.

SECTION 102 APPLICABILITY
SECTION 102.3 CHANGE OF OCCUPANCY.
Section 102.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

102.3 Change of Use or Occupancy. No change shall be made in the use or occupancy
of any structure, which would place the structure in a different division of the same group
or occupancy or in a different group of occupancies, unless such structure is made to
comply with the requirements of this code and the California Building Code. Subject to the
approval of the fire and building code officials, the use or occupancy of an existing structure
shall be allowed to be changed, and the structure is allowed to be occupied for purposes
in other groups without conforming to all the requirements of this code and the California
Building Code for those groups, provided the new or proposed use is less hazardous,
based on life and fire risk, than the existing use.

SECTION 102.6 HISTORIC BUILDINGS.
Section 102.6 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

102.6 Historic Buildings. The provisions of this Code relating to the construction,
alteration, repair, enlargement, restoration, relocation, or moving of buildings or structures
shall not be mandatory for existing buildings or structures identified and classified by the
state or local jurisdiction as historic buildings when such buildings or structures do not
constitute a distinct hazard to life or property. Fire protection in designated historic
buildings and structures shall be provided in accordance with Part 8 of Title 24 of the 2016
California Historic Building Code, as amended.

SECTION 102.13 APPLICATION OF PERFORMANCE CODE FOR BUILDINGS AND
FACILITIES.

Section 102.13 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

Page 4 of 30



102.13 Application of Performance Code for Buildings and Facilities. Where
application is made to the fire code official for approval of alternative equivalent designs,
performance-based designs or other designs under 104.9 of the North Central Fire
Protection District Fire Code, in new or existing buildings, the 2018 edition of the
International Code Council Performance Code for Buildings and Facilities is hereby
adopted. This code shall regulate and govern the alternative equivalent design,
performance-based design, other design where applicable, construction, alteration,
modification, extension, quality of materials, erection, installation, alteration, repair,
location, relocation, replacement, addition to, improvement of, use or maintenance of,
building and/or fire protection systems, components, equipment and materials.

SECTION 103 DEPARTMENT OF FIRE PREVENTION
SECTION 103.1 GENERAL.
Section 103.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

103.1 General. The department of fire prevention is established within the jurisdiction
under the direction of the fire code official. The function of the department shall be the
implementation, administration, and enforcement of the provisions of this code.

Whenever the terms “fire department”, “district”, “department of fire prevention," "fire
prevention bureau," "fire prevention division", or "community risk reduction unit" are used
in this Code or the North Central Fire Protection District Code, the terms shall mean those
personnel assigned to, and engaged in, the prevention or investigation of fire on behalf of
the North Central Fire Protection District.

SECTION 103.2 APPOINTMENT.
Section 103.2 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

103.2 Appointment. The fire code official shall be appointed by the district fire chief
appointing authority of the North Central Fire Protection District.

SECTION 103.3 DEPUTIES.
Section 103.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

103.3 Deputies. In accordance with the prescribed procedures of the North Central Fire
Protection District and with the concurrence of the appointing authority, the fire code
official shall have the authority to appoint a deputy fire code official, other related technical
officers, inspectors and other employees.

SECTION 103.4 LIABILITY.

Page 5 of 30



Section 103.4 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

103.4 Liability. The fire code official, the North Central Fire Protection Board of Directors,
officer or employee charged with the enforcement of this code, while acting for the North
Central Fire Protection District, in good faith and without malice in the discharge of the
duties required by this code or other pertinent law or the North Central Fire Protection
District ordinance, shall not thereby be rendered civilly or criminally liable personally, and
is hereby relieved from all personal liability for any damage accruing to persons or property
as a result of an act or by reason of an act or omission in the discharge of official duties.

SECTION 103.4.1 LEGAL DEFENSE.
Section 103.4.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

103.4.1 Legal Defense. Any suit or criminal complaint instituted against any officer or
employee because of an act performed by that officer or employee in the lawful discharge
of duties and under the provisions of this code shall be defended by the legal
representatives of the North Central Fire Protection District until the final termination of the
proceedings. The fire code official or any subordinate shall not be liable for costs in an
action, suit or proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the provisions of this code; and
any officer of the district of fire prevention, acting in good faith and without malice, shall be
free from liability for acts performed under any of its provisions or by reason of any act or
omission in the performance of official duties in connection therewith.

SECTION 104 GENERAL AUTHORITY AND RESPONSIBILITIES
SECTION 104.3 RIGHT OF ENTRY.
Section 104.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

104.3 Right of Entry. Where it is necessary to make an inspection to enforce the
provisions of this code, or where the fire code official has reasonable cause to believe that
there exists in a building or on any premises any conditions or violations of this code that
make the building or premises unsafe, dangerous or hazardous, the fire code official or
designee shall have the authority to enter the building or premises at all reasonable times
to inspect or to perform the duties imposed on the fire code official by this code. If such
building or premises is occupied, the fire code official or designee shall present credentials
to the occupant and request entry. If such building or premises is unoccupied, the fire code
official or designee shall first make a reasonable effort to locate the owner, the owner’s
authorized agent or other person having charge or control of the building or premises and
request entry. If entry is refused, the fire code official has recourse to every remedy
provided by law to secure entry.

Page 6 of 30



SECTION 104.3.1 WARRANT.
Section 104.3.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

104.3.1 Warrant. Where the fire code official has first obtained a proper inspection warrant
or other remedy provided by law to secure entry, an owner, the owner’s authorized agent
or occupant or person having charge, care or control of the building or premises shall not
fail or neglect, after proper request is made as herein provided, to permit entry therein by
the fire code official or designee for the purpose of inspection and examination pursuant to

this code.

SECTION 104.3.2 INSPECTION FREQUENCY.
Section 104.3.2 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

104.3.2 Inspection Frequency. The fire code official shall be authorized to establish a
minimum inspection frequency for all occupancy groups where not already determined by
the State of California Health and Safety Code.

SECTION 104.4 IDENTIFICATION.
Section 104.4 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

104.4 Identification. The fire code official or designee shall carry proper identification
when inspecting structures or premises in the performance of duties under this code.

SECTION 105 PERMITS
SECTION 105.6 REQUIRED OPERATIONAL PERMITS.
Section 105.6 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

105.6 Required Operational Permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
operational permits for the operations set forth in Section 105.6.1 through Section
105.6.48. Required permits will be issued only for those operations where a permit fee has
been established by Master Fee Schedule.

SECTION 105 6.14 EXHIBITS, TRADE SHOWS AND SPECIAL EVENTS.
Section 105.6.14 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

105.6.14 Exhibits, Trade Shows, and Special Events. An operational permit is required
to operate exhibits, trade shows, and special events.

Page 7 of 30



SECTION 105 6.16 FIRE HYDRANTS.
Section 105.6.16 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

105.6.16 Fire Hydrants. A permit is required to use fire hydrants intended for fire
suppression purposes, which are installed on water systems and accessible to public
roadways, alleys, or public utility easements on private property. Such permit shall be
obtained from the City of Fresno Water Division, the City of Kerman Public Works, or
persons responsible for providing water to such hydrants or water systems within a
waterworks or community services district. Also see Sections 901.5 and 901.8.

Exception: A permit is not required for authorized employees of the water company, which
supplies the system or the fire department to use or operate fire hydrants or valves.

SECTION 105.6.32 OPEN BURNING.
Section 105.6.32 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

105.6.32 Open Burning. An operational permit is required for any open burning, including
for the kindling or maintaining of an open fire or a fire on any public street, alley, road, or
other public or private ground, including recreational fires. Instructions and stipulations of
the permit shall be adhered to.

An operational permit may only be issued after a permit has been obtained from the San
Joaquin Valley Air Pollution Control District.

SECTION 105.7 REQUIRED CONSTRUCTION PERMITS.
Section 105.7 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

105.7 Required Construction Permits. The fire code official is authorized to issue
construction permits for work as set forth in Section 105.7.1 through Section 105.7.18.
Required permits will be issued only for those operations where a permit fee has been
established by Master Fee Schedule.

SECTION 105.7.1 AUTOMATIC FIRE EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS.
Section 105.7.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

105.7.1 Automatic Fire Extinguishing Systems. A construction permit is required for
installation of or modification to an automatic fire extinguishing system.

SECTION 105.7.16 LP-GAS.

Section 105.7.16 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

Page 8 of 30



105.7.16 LP-Gas. A construction permit is required for installation or modification of LP-
Gas tanks with a capacity (single or aggregate) in excess of 500 gallons.

SECTION 108 MAINTENANCE
SECTION 108.6 OVERCROWDING.
Section 108.6 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

108.6 Overcrowding. Overcrowding or admittance of any person beyond the approved
capacity of a building or a portion thereof shall not be allowed. The fire code official or
designee, on finding any overcrowding conditions or obstructions in aisles, passageways
or other means of egress, or on finding any condition that constitutes a life safety hazard,
shall be authorized to cause the event to be stopped until such condition or obstruction is
corrected.

SECTION 109 BOARD OF APPEALS
SECTION 109.2 LIMITATIONS ON AUTHORITY.
Section 109.2 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

109.2 Limitations on Authority. An application for appeal shall be based on a claim that
the intent of this code or the rules legally adopted hereunder have been incorrectly
interpreted, the provisions of this code do not fully apply, or an equivalent method of
protection or safety is proposed. The board shall not have authority to waive requirements
of this code. An economic condition shall not be considered as a basis for an appeal of the
provisions of this Code.

SECTION 109.4 COST RECOVERY.
Section 109.4 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

109.4 Cost Recovery. The fire code official or designee is authorized to-recover any direct
or indirect costs for fire prevention, fire suppression, hazardous material incident response,
and protection of the public from fire and life safety hazards.

109.4.1 Fire Prevention Cost Recovery. Any person or firm who fails to, or refuses to,
correct, within the time allotted for correction, any fire hazard prohibited by code, regulation
or law, for which a public agency has issued a notice of violation or correction respecting
the hazard, or failure to comply with a written notice of violation is liable for the fire
prevention costs, and any other costs, incurred in furtherance of the abatement of the fire
hazard, and those costs shall be a charge against that person.

Page 9 of 30



109.4.2 Fire Suppression Cost Recovery. Any person or firm who causes a fire, sets a
fire, allows a fire to be set, or allows a fire kindled or attended by him or her to escape onto
any public or private property, is liable for the fire suppression costs, rescue or emergency
medical services costs, and any other costs incurred as a result of fighting the fire.

109.4.3 Hazardous Materials Release Cost Recovery. Any person or firm who releases
a hazardous material, allows a hazardous material to be released, causes, or allows a
hazardous material attended by him or her to escape onto any public or private property,
is liable for the hazardous material incident response, rescue or emergency medical
services costs, and any other costs incurred as a result of responding to the hazardous
material release.

109.4.4 Protection of the Public Cost Recovery. Any person or firm who creates a fire
or life safety hazard to the public, allows a fire or life safety hazard to the public, causes,
or allows a fire or life safety hazard to the public to escape onto any public or private
property, is liable for the fire or life safety hazard incident response, rescue or emergency
medical services costs, and any other costs incurred as a result of responding to the fire
or life safety hazard to the public.

109.4.5 Action and Administration. Cost recovery actions and administration pursuant
to this section shall be as set forth in the Master Fee Schedule and fire department policy,
and shall constitute a debt of such person, and is collectable by the North Central Fire
Protection District in the same manner as in the case of an obligation under a contract,
express or implied.

109.4.6 Other Laws. The provisions of this section shall not be deemed to nullify or
prevent the application, either cumulatively, concurrently, or separately, of the provisions
of the California Health and Safety Code or any other law related to liability

SECTION 110 VIOLATIONS
SECTION 110.3.1 SERVICE.
Section 110.3.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

110.3.1 Service. A notice of violation issued pursuant to this code shall be served upon
the owner, operator, occupant, or other person responsible for the condition of violation
either by personal service, mail, or by delivering the same to, and leaving it with, some
person of responsibility upon the premises. For unattended or abandoned properties, a
copy of such notice shall be sent by first class mail to the last known address of the owner,
occupant, or both. The fire code official is authorized to issue an administrative citation for
abatement of violations of this code in accordance with fire department policy

Page 10 of 30



SECTION 110.4 VIOLATION PENALTIES.
Section 110.4 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

110.4 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate any provisions of said California Fire.
Code or these amendments, or fail to comply therewith, or who shall violate or fail to comply
with any order made thereunder, or who shall build in violation of any detailed statement
of specifications or plans submitted and approved thereunder or any certificate or permit
issued thereunder, and from which no appeal has been taken, or who shall fail to comply
with such an order as affirmed or modified by the Board of Directors or by a court of
competent jurisdiction within the time fixed therein, shall severally for each and every such
violation and noncompliance, respectively, be guilty of a misdemeanor. Upon failure to
comply with a written notice of violation, the fire code official may request that the Fresno
County District Attorney institute legal action. The imposition of a penalty for any violation
shall not excuse the violation or permit it to continue, and all such persons shall be required
to correct or remedy such violations or defects within a reasonable time as determined by
the fire code official. For each day or portion of a day prohibited conditions are maintained
shall constitute a separate offense. The application of the penalty set forth in this
subsection of this section shall not be held to prevent the district from abating the
conditions. The Fire Chief or designee is authorized to issue administrative citations in
accordance with written procedures and Master Fee Schedule charges approved by the
Board.

110.4.1 Abatement of Violation. In addition to the imposition of the penalties herein
described, the fire code official is authorized to institute appropriate action to prevent
unlawful construction or to restrain, correct or abate a violation; or to prevent illegal
occupancy of a structure or premises; or to stop an illegal act, conduct of business or
occupancy of a structure on or about any premises. Such action is subject to the cost
recovery provisions of Section 109.4.

SECTION 112 STOP WORK ORDER
SECTION 112.4 FAILURE TO COMPLY.
Section 112.4 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

112.4 Failure to Comply. Any persons who shall continue any work after having been
served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is directed to perform to
remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be subject to an administrative citation or
other judicial or administrative action in accordance with Section 109.4.

SECTION 113 SERVICE UTILITIES

Page 11 of 30



SECTION 113.2 AUTHORITY TO REQUIRE CONNECTION TO SERVICE UTILITIES.
Section 113.2 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

113.2 Authority to Require Connection to Service Utilities. The fire code official shall
have the authority to require connection of utility services to the building, structure or
system to a recognized service utility provider in order to ensure the safety of occupants
and the preservation of the structure. Utility services may include, but are not limited to,
water service, electrical service, gas service, or any other utility service. The fire code
official may refuse to issue any permits until the owner of the building, structure or system
provides proof of connection to the utility service.

SECTION 114 FEES FOR FIRE INSPECTIONS
SECTION 114.1 FEES FOR FIRE INSPECTION.
Section 114.1 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

114.1 Fees for Fire Inspections. The fire code official shall be authorized to charge a fee
for fire inspections of existing buildings and properties within the North Central Fire
Protection District. Fees for such services shall be in accordance with fire department
policy.

DEFINITIONS
SECTION 202 GENERAL DEFINITIONS
The following definitions are added to Section 202 of the California Fire Code to read:

FIRE DEPARTMENT BYPASS KEY. An approved key used by authorized emergency
services personnel to bypass secured access locations.

FIRE MARSHAL. A chief fire officer of the fire department or a duly authorized
representative, who is charged with either the prevention or investigation of fires.

RECYLCING AND INDUSTRIAL WASTE. Any material which has been recycled,
including post-consumer or industrial waste, wood by-products or other similar products.

RECYLCING AND INDUSTRIAL WASTE HANDLING FACILITY. Any site that stores,
manufactures, processes or handles wood by-products, recycled materials, including post-
consumer waste, industrial waste, or other similar materials.

GENERAL REQUIREMENTS
SECTION 304 COMBUSTIBLE WASTE MATERIAL

Page 12 of 30



SECTION 304.4 RECYCLING AND INDUSTRIAL WASTE HANDLING FACILITIES.
Section 304.4 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

304.4 Recycling and Industrial Waste Handling Facilities. See Chapter 28 of the CFC
and this ordinance for specific requirements related to recycling and industrial waste
handling facilities. Recycling and industrial waste handling facilities shall also be in
accordance with applicable fire department policies.

SECTION 304.5 DUMPING OF COMBUSTIBLE WASTE MATERIAL.
Section 304.5 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

304.5 Dumping of Combustible Waste Material. No owner or occupant of any Lot, site
or premises shall maintain thereon any rubbish or waste material likely to become easily
ignited, and, provided further, no person shall place, deposit, or leave any piles of dirt,
metallic cans, combustible waste, or rubbish on any property not owned or controlled by
such person or persons.

SECTION 304.6 REMOVAL OF DEBRIS.
Section 304.6 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

304.6 Removal of Debris. Any person having in their possession or under their control,
upon any premises, any kind of materials, which have been rendered useless or un-
merchandisable by reasons of any fire on the premises, or any other debris resulting from
such fire, must commence to remove the same from the premises within twenty-four (24)
hours after notice to do so from the fire department, and must thereupon proceed with and
diligently carry on the work of such removal until the same has been completed.

SECTION 307 OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES AND PORTABLE
OUTDOOR FIREPLACES

SECTION 307.1.1 PROHIBITED OPEN BURNING.
Section 307.1.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

307.1.1 Prohibited Open Burning. Notwithstanding other provision in Section 307, open
burning is prohibited as follows:

1. Open burning that is offensive or objectionable because of smoke emissions or
when atmospheric conditions or local circumstances make such fires hazardous shall be
prohibited.

Page 13 of 30



2. Open burning in violation of the rules or regulations promulgated by the San Joaquin
Valley Air Pollution Control District.

3. The fire code official is authorized to order, or effect the immediate extinguishment,
of any open burning when in the opinion of the fire code official is reasonably necessary
for safety and protection of life and health, and may issue administrative citations and seek
to recover costs in accordance with Sections 109.4 of this Code.

SECTION 312 VEHICLE IMPACT PROTECTION
SECTION 312.1 GENERAL.
Section 312.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

312.1 General. Vehicle impact protection required by this Code shall be provided by posts
that comply with Section 312.2 of the CFC or by other approved physical barriers that
comply with 312.3 of the CFC

Exception: Fire hydrants and fire sprinkler risers may be protected in accordance with fire
district policies (Fire hydrant installation with protector posts) as incorporated here by
reference.

FIRE SERVICE FEATURES
SECTION 503 FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS
SECTION 503.5 REQUIRED GATES OR BARRICADES.
Section 503.5 of the California Fire Code amended to read:

503.5 Required Gates or Barricades. The fire code official is authorized to require the
installation and maintenance of gates or other approved barricades across fire apparatus
access roads, trails or other access ways, not including public streets, alleys or highways.
Electric gate operators, where provided, shall be listed in accordance with UL 325. Gates
intended for automatic operation shall be designed, constructed and installed to comply
with the requirements of ASTM F 2200. Entrances to roads, trails or other access ways
which have been closed with gates and barriers shall not be obstructed by parked vehicles.
Any vehicle parking in violation of this section shall be subject to being towed away and
stored. The registered owner of any vehicle parked in violation of this section shall be
responsible for all expenses incurred in connection with the towing and storage of such
vehicle.

SECTION 506 LOCKED PREMISES ACCESS.

Page 14 of 30



Section 506 of the California Fire Code is renamed and amended to read:

506.1 Where Required. Where access to, or within a structure or an area is restricted
because of secured openings, the fire code official is authorized to require key boxes to
be installed in approved locations. Installation requirements and key box contents shall be
in accordance with fire department policy.

506.1.1 Locks. An approved lock or remote opening device shall be installed on gates or
similar barriers when required by the fire code official in accordance with fire department
policy.

506.1.1.1 Unauthorized Possession of Fire Department Bypass Key. It shall be
unlawful for any person other than those authorized by the fire code official to possess a
fire department bypass key.

506.1.1.2 Unauthorized Duplication of Fire Department Bypass Key. No person shall
duplicate a fire department bypass key unless approved by the fire code official.

506.1.1.3 Penalties. Any person who shall violate either section 506.1.1.1 or 506.1.1.2
shall be guilty of a misdemeanor. Prosecution of such violations shall be in accordance
with the California Penal Code.

506.2 Key Box Maintenance. The operator of the building or premises shall immediately
notify the fire code official and provide the new key when a lock is changed or re-keyed.
The key to such lock shall be secured in the key box.

SECTION 507 FIRE PROTECTION WATER SUPPLIES
SECTION 507.3 FIRE FLOW.
Section 507.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

507.3 Fire Flow. Fire flow requirements for buildings or portions of buildings and facilities
shall be determined by an approved method or Appendix B. Fire flow requirements for
buildings or portions of buildings and facilities shall be in accordance with fire department
policy, approved by the North Central Fire Protection District Board of Directors.

INTERIOR FINISH, DECORATIVE MATERIALS AND FURNISHINGS

SECTION 807 DECORATIVE MATERIALS AND ARTIFICIAL DECORATIVE
VEGETATION IN NEW AND EXISTING BUILDINGS

SECTION 807.5.1.3 WOOD USE IN GROUP A-3 PLACES OF RELIGIOUS WORSHIP.

Section 807.5.1.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

Page 15 of 30



807.5.1.3 Wood use in Group A-3 Places of Religious Worship. In new and existing
places of religious worship, wood used for ornamental purposes, trusses, paneling or
chancel furnishing shall be allowed where such material meets the flame spread
requirements found in Table 803.3.

FIRE PROTECTION AND LIFE SAFETY SYSTEMS
SECTION 901 GENERAL
SECTION 901.6.3.2 PROBLEMATIC SYSTEMS.
Section 901.6.3.2 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

901.6.3.2 Problematic Systems. In the event of multiple fire alarm, fire detection, or fire
sprinkler monitoring system activations, the fire code official is authorized to charge the
property owner for the direct and indirect costs of each emergency response. After
responding to two (2) false alarm at the same facility in any calendar year from July 1
through June 30", the cost of each response will be billed at the base rate established in
the Master Fee Schedule or actual time spent on the response, whichever is greater.
Action and administration to recover these costs shall be in accordance with section 1

09.4.
SECTION 903 AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS
SECTION 903.1 GENERAL.
Section 903.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to add the following sub-sections:

903.1.2 Determination of Building Area. For purposes of determining building area for
automatic fire sprinkler system requirements, the following criteria shall be used:

1. Fire walls, fire barriers, fire partitions, or horizontal fire assemblies as defined in this
Code shall not be considered to create separate buildings or fire areas for determining
automatic fire sprinkler requirements.

Exceptions:

(a) Party walls located on a lot line between two buildings in accordance with California
Building Code, Section 706.

(b)  Fire walls without openings installed in accordance with California Building Code,
Section 706 and with specific fire wall requirements in Section 903.2 of this Code based
on occupancy.

Page 16 of 30



2. Determination of building area for combustible construction shall be measured to
the building perimeter roof drip line, including any architectural features, such as, but not
limited to, mansards, towers, porte cocheres, etc., with the exception of 44" maximum
depth roof eaves. For non-combustible construction, building area shall include all
perimeter roof areas exceeding 44" that are required by the currently adopted edition of
NFPA 13 to have fire sprinkler protection under the projection. The area of open shafts or
courts need not be included in calculating floor area. When multiple buildings are
considered as one building per California Building Code Section 705.3, the combined floor
areas shall be used to determine the automatic fire sprinkler requirements.

SECTION 903.3.1 STANDARDS.
Section 903.3.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

903.3.1 Standards. Sprinkler systems shall be designed in accordance with Sections
903.3.1.1, 903.3.1.2, and 903.3.1.3. Automatic fire sprinklers or fire sprinkler systems not
required by the California Fire or Building Codes may be of any type approved by the fire
code official.

903.3.1.1.3. Group R Mixed Occupancy Buildings. Mixed occupancy buildings containing
Group R occupancies shall be provided with automatic sprinkler systems in accordance
with Section 903.3.1.1 (NFPA 13). The R-2 or R-3 residential portion of a mixed occupancy
building shall be provided with fire sprinkler piping and control valves arranged so that the
automatic sprinkler system can remain in service independent of non-residential
occupancies.

Exceptions:

1. Mixed occupancy buildings where a vertical fire barrier with no openings is provided
in accordance with California Building Code, Section 707 separating the R occupancy from
other uses may have automatic fire sprinkler systems installed in the residential portion in
accordance with Sections 903.3.1.2 (NFPA 13R) or 903.3.1.3 (NFPA 13D) as applicable.
Separate control valves shall be installed as indicated above unless otherwise approved
by the fire code official.

2. Group R-1 or R-2 occupancies with accessory occupancy groups that do not
require installation of fire sprinklers by Section 903.2.

903.3.1.1.4. Joint Live Work Units Quarters. Where joint live/work residential dwelling units
are constructed in accordance with California Fire Code, Chapter 1 1, Article 7, automatic
sprinkler systems shall be designed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 (NFPA 13).

SECTION 903.4.3. FLOOR CONTROL VALVES.

Page 17 of 30



Section 903.4.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

903.4.3. Floor Control Valves. Approved supervised indicating control valves and water
flow switches shall be provided at the point of connection to the riser on each floor in
buildings with three or more levels or where the floor level of the highest story is located
more than 30 feet above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access. The building
fire alarm, dedicated function fire alarm system or remote annunciator panel shall be
provided at an approved location, readily accessible to the fire department and shall
indicate the floor of activation of these devices.

Exception: NFPA 13R and 13D systems.
SECTION 903.6. WHERE REQUIRED IN EXISTING BUILDINGS AND STRUCTURES
Section 903.6 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

903.6 Where required in existing buildings and structures. An approved automatic fire
extinguishing system shall be provided in existing buildings and structures, including R3
occupancies, in those circumstances described in this Section and where required in
Chapter 1 1. Installation requirements shall be as set forth for new buildings by Sections
903.2 through 903.2.12 and, where applicable, the California Residential Code.

1. Building Additions. When additions exceed 25% of the existing building square
footage and the total proposed building area is 7,500 square feet or larger, an approved
automatic fire extinguishing system shall be installed throughout the building. The 25%
threshold shall be cumulative over the life of the building. Exception: Building additions of
entirely non-combustible construction and noncombustible uses such as covered
pedestrian walkways.

2. Change of Occupancy. In existing buildings 7,500 square feet or larger, when a
Change of Occupancy, in accordance with the California Building Code, is made and the
proposed new occupancy is more hazardous to life and safety than the existing occupancy,
an approved automatic fire extinguishing system shall be installed throughout the building.
The determination of a more hazardous use or occupancy shall be made in accordance
with fire department policy. See policy 402.005.

Exceptions:

(a) If the area in which the Change of Occupancy occurs is less than 25 percent of the
actual floor area of the existing building and the area of the new occupancy is 7,499 square
feet or less and an automatic fire extinguishing system is not required based on occupancy
by Section 903, an automatic fire sprinkler or extinguishing system is not required for any
portion of the building. The 25% limit is cumulative over the life of the building.

Page 18 of 30



(b)  Ifthe area in which the Change of Occupancy occurs exceeds 25% but is less than
50% of the actual floor area of the existing building, only that portion of the building
changing occupancy is required to have an approved automatic fire extinguishing system
installed. An approved fire separation shall be required between portions of the building
with an automatic fire extinguishing system and those portions without.

(c)  If individual or cumulative Changes of Occupancy exceed 50% of the overall floor
area of the existing building, then the entire building shall have an approved automatic fire
extinguishing system installed throughout.

3. Fire Damage Repairs. An approved automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed
as a condition of a fire damage repair building permit as follows:

(a) When a fire occurs in any existing occupancy, including R-3 occupancies, and the
building permit repair costs exceed 50% of the current building valuation, an automatic fire
extinguishing system shall be installed throughout the building as required for a new
building in Section 903 or R313.

(b)  Fire damage repair costs and building valuation shall be determined by the Building
Official of Fresno County or City of Kerman based on the current ICC Building Valuation
Tables in use by the respective department at the time of the issuance of the fire damage
repair permit.

4. R-2 Condominium Conversions. Existing R-1 or R-2 buildings proposed for
conversion to condominiums shall have an approved automatic fire extinguishing system
installed throughout as a condition of approval.

D A-l and A-2 Occupancies. In existing A-l and A-2 occupancies an approved
automatic fire extinguishing system shall be installed throughout the entire building as a
condition of any building permit where the permit cost is one-thousand ($1,000) or more.

Exception: Building permits issued exclusively for mechanical systems, plumbing systems,
electrical systems and re-roofing only.

SECTION 912 FIRE DEPARTMENT CONNECTIONS
SECTION 912.2.3 ADDRESS IDENTIFICATION.
Section 912.2.3 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

912.2.3 Address Identification. For new and existing buildings, the fire code official is
authorized to require approved address or building area identification signage as needed
to readily determine the building or area of a building protected by fire department
connections.

Page 19 of 30



MEANS OF EGRESS
SECTION 1025 LUMINOUS EGRESS PATH MARKINGS
SECTION 1025.1. GENERAL.
Section 1025.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

1025.1 General. Approved luminous egress path markings delineating the exit path shall
be provided in all new buildings three or more stories above grade or below grade in
accordance with Sections 1025.1 through 1025.5.

1. Luminous egress path markings shall not be required on the level of exit discharge
in lobbies that serve as part of the exit path in accordance with Section 1028.1.

2. Luminous egress path markings shall not be required in open parking garages that
serve as part of the exit path in accordance with Section 1028.1.

3: R-3 occupancies.

1025.1.1. Maintenance. Luminous egress path markings required in this section shall be
maintained in accordance with Sections 1025.1 through 1025.5 and fire department policy
as applicable.

FLAMMABLE FINISHES
SECTION 2401 GENERAL
SECTION 2401.1.2 LOCATION.
Section 2401.1.2 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

2401.1.2 Location. Locations or areas used for any of the operations noted in 2401.1 shall
be located in accordance with the respective regulating agencies or departments and fire
department policy.

LUMBER YARDS AND ARGO-INDUSTRIAL, SOLID BIOMASS AND
WOODWORKING FACILITIES

SECTION 2811 RECYCLING AND WASTE HANDLING FACILITIES
SECTION 2811.1 SCOPE.

Section 2811.1 of the California Fire Code is added to read:

Page 20 of 30



2811.1 Scope. The storage, manufacturing, processing or handling of wood byproducts,
recycled materials, industrial waste, and other similar materials not otherwise regulated by
this code shall be in accordance with this section and fire department policy. The title of
this Section shall be "RECYCLING AND WASTE HANDLING FACILITIES."

EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS
SECTION 5602 FIREWORKS ORDINANCE.
Section 5602 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

5602.1 Firework Ordinance. This Section shall be known and cited as the "Fireworks
Ordinance." When used, "this Section" means the Fireworks Ordinance.

5602.1.1 Definitions. The following terms are defined in Charter 2.

5602.2 Findings and Intent.

(a) This Section governs the imposition, enforcement, collection and administrative
review of all administrative fines related to: the possession, use, storage, sale and/or
display of those fireworks classified as dangerous fireworks in California Health and Safety
Code, Section 12505 et seq. or the possession, use, storage, sale and/or display of Safe
and Sane fireworks on or at dates, times, and/or locations other than those permitted by
this Section. The administrative fines are imposed under authority of Government Code,
Section 53069.4; Health and Safety Code, Section 12557; and, the police power of the
North Central Fire Protection District.

(b) The issuance of an administrative citation to any person or property owner
constitutes but one remedy of the District to redress violations of this Section. By adopting
this Section, the District does not intend to limit its authority to employ any other remedy,
civil or criminal, to redress any violation of this Section which the District may otherwise
pursue.

(c)  The imposition of administrative fines under this Section shall be limited to persons
who possess, use, sell and/or display, or the seizure of 25 pounds or less of dangerous
fireworks or persons who possess, use, sell and/or display Safe and Sane fireworks on or
at the dates, times, and/ or locations other than those permitted by this Section.

(d)  Administrative fines collected pursuant to this Section shall not be subject to Health
and Safety Code, Section 12706. The administrative fines collected shall be allocated in
compliance with Health and Safety Code, Section 12557, which requires the District to
provide cost reimbursement to the California State Fire Marshal for reimbursement of
costs, including, but not limited to transportation, and disposal. Regulations are to be

Page 21 of 30



adopted by the California State Fire Marshal setting forth this allocation. Unless and until
such regulations have been adopted by the State of California, the District shall hold in
trust a $250.00 fee in addition to any fine collected to cover the reimbursement to the
California State Fire Marshal for the cost of transportation and disposal of the dangerous
fireworks. This fee is non-refundable.

(e) Due to the serious threat of fire or injury posed by the use of dangerous fireworks
or Safe and Sane fireworks on or at dates, times, and/or locations other than those
permitted by this Section, this Section imposes strict civil liability upon the owners of
commercial or residential real property for all violations of this Section existing on that
property. Each contiguous use, display, and/or possession shall constitute a separate
violation and shall be subject to a separate administrative fine.

(H The fire code official or designee may seek cost recovery for any costs imposed on
the District or Fire Department due to negligence, an intentional wrongful act, an
unintentional wrongful act, carelessness, or malice as set forth in Section 109.4 of this
Code, and the Master Fee Schedule.

(g) This section shall not apply to the public display of fireworks in accordance with
Section 5608.

(h)  This section shall not apply to the storage and handling of Safe and Sane fireworks
in accordance with the California Building Code for Class 1.4G fireworks

5602.3 Definitions

(a) "Dangerous fireworks" shall include any items or materials listed as such in
California Health and Safety Code, Section 12505.

(b)  "Eligible organizations" means an organization or corporation, which has met all of
the following criteria continuously for a minimum of one year preceding the filing of the
application for a permit to display for sale or sell Safe and Sane fireworks.

() The organization and/or corporation must be a duly organized non-profit and tax-
exempt charitable, religious, civic, patriotic, or community service organization or
corporation with a current and valid title 26 U.S.C Section 501 (c) tax exemption from the
Internal Revenue Service.

(i)  The organization must be headquartered within and clearly affiliated or identified
with the North Central Fire Protection District.

(iii)  The organization must be one which provides direct and regular community services
and benefits to the citizens of the North Central Fire Protection District.

Page 22 of 30



(iv)  The organization must hold its regularly scheduled meetings within the North Central
Fire Protection District.

(c) "Exempt fireworks" means any special item containing pyrotechnic compositions
which the California State Fire Marshal, with the advice of the State Fire Advisory Board,
has investigated and determined to be limited to industrial, commercial, and agricultural
use, or religious ceremonies when authorized by a permit granted by the authority having
jurisdiction.

(d) "Fireworks" means any device containing chemical elements and chemical
compounds capable of burning independently of the oxygen of the atmosphere and
producing audible, visual, mechanical, or thermal effects which are useful as pyrotechnic
devices or for entertainment. These items include, but are not limited to:

()  Devices designated by the manufacturer as fireworks.

(i)  Torpedoes, skyrockets, roman candles, rockets, Daygo bombs, sparklers, party
poppers, paper caps, chasers, fountains, smoke sparks, aerial bombs, and fireworks kits.

(e) "Safe and Sane fireworks" means any fireworks which do not come within the
definition of "dangerous fireworks" or "exempt fireworks." All Safe and Sane fireworks shall
be labeled with the Safe and Sane fireworks seal as authorized by the California State Fire
Marshal.

5602.4 General Prohibition Against Possession, Sale, Use and/or Display of
Fireworks.

Except as otherwise provided in this Section, no person shall possess, sell, use, display,
explode or discharge any fireworks within the North Central Fire Protection District.

5602.5 Safe and Sane Fireworks: Exceptions.

(a) The sale and/or display of Safe and Sane Fireworks shall be permitted only during
that period beginning at noon on June 28 and ending at noon on July 6 of the same year.

(b) Safe and Sane fireworks shall not be sold to any person under the age of sixteen
(16).

(c) The use and discharge of Safe and Sane fireworks within the North Central Fire
Protection District is permitted 365 days a year, between the hours of 7:00 a.m. and 10:00
p.m., except for the period of June 28 to July 6 when use and discharge will be allowed
between the hours of 7:00 a.m. and 12:00 a.m.

5602.6 Safe and Sane Fireworks Permits. Permits Required:

Page 23 of 30



(a) Iltis unlawful for any person to sell Safe and Sane fireworks within the North Central
Fire Protection District without a permit issued by the fire code official or designee.

(b) The fire code official is authorized to promulgate administrative rules and
procedures necessary for the successful and effective implementation of this Section
including rules and procedures governing the submission of applications for permits to sell
Safe and Sane fireworks, inspections of fireworks stands, operation of fireworks stands,
and such regulations relating to the sale of Safe and Sane fireworks as may be necessary
for the protection of life and property.

(b)  The fire code official or designee shall be responsible for reviewing applications for
permits to sell Safe and Sane fireworks.

5602.7 Safe and Sane Fireworks. Applications:

(a) All organizations or corporations interested in obtaining a permit to sell Safe and
Sane fireworks shall submit an application to the fire department on forms provided by the
fire department. There is a non-refundable application fee established by ordinance of the
Board of Directors and set forth in the Master Fee Schedule. This application fee shall be
in addition to any fee or tax imposed by any other chapter or article of the North Central
Fire Protection District Fire Code.

(b)  The fire code official or designee shall designate the time period when applications
will be accepted.

(c) No organization shall submit more than one application. Submittal of more than one
application shall be grounds for denial of all applications submitted by that organization.

(d)  There shall be allowed a maximum of thirty-one (31) fireworks stands in the North
Central Fire Protection District. Stands which meet the requirement of this code will be
allowed to remain until they relinquish their position. Any of the non-profit organizations
which operated in accordance with previous District policy as of December 31, 2007, will
retain their position until they relinquish it.

(e) Ifthere are less than thirty-one (31) eligible stands, then a lottery shall take place at
a time and location determined by the fire code official or designee, with all eligible
organizations on the waiting list to fill empty positions.

(f) Each new participant, as well as the previously permitted participants, shall submit
additional information as required by the fire department which shall be reviewed prior to
issuance of any permits to sell Safe and Sane fireworks for the upcoming fireworks season

Page 24 of 30



5602.8 Safe and Sane Fireworks. Issuance of Permits:

(a) No permit to sell Safe and Sane fireworks shall be issued to any organization except
non-profit and tax-exempt organizations or corporations organized primarily for charitable,
religious, civic, patriotic, or community service as defined in Section 5602.3(b).

(b)  Upon notification that the organization has been selected by lottery to participate in
the upcoming fireworks season, each organization shall provide additional information as
required by the fire department including, but not limited to:

(i) A non-refundable fee established by ordinance of the North Central Fire Protection
District and set forth in the Master Fee Schedule. This fee shall be in addition to any fee
or tax imposed by any other chapter or article of the North Central Fire Protection District
ordinance adopting the 2019 California Fire Code.

(i)  An executed Indemnification and Hold Harmless Agreement as required by the
North Central Fire Protection District Attorney or designee.

(iif)  Throughout the life of the permit, the applicant shall pay for and maintain in full force
and effect policies of insurance as required by the North Central Fire Protection District
Attorney or designee. The policies of insurance shall name the North Central Fire
Protection District, its officers, officials, agents, employees and authorized volunteers as
additional insured. The applicant shall submit proof of insurance in a manner authorized
by the North Central Fire Protection District Attorney or designee.

(iv)  Other information as may be required by the fire department or North Central Fire
Protection District, pursuant to administrative rules and procedures promulgated by the fire
code official pursuant to Section 5502.6(b).

(c) Permits shall be issued upon review of all information submitted by the organization
and inspection and approval of the organization's temporary fireworks stand.

5602.9 Safe and Sane Fireworks. Operator Safety Seminar:

Each year, one or more representatives from each organization that is granted a permit to
sell or display fireworks shall attend a stand operator safety seminar conducted by the
North Central Fire Protection District or the fireworks industry. Failure of an organization
to have a responsible individual attend the seminar shall result in the revocation of the
permit.

5602.10 Revocation of Permits. The fire code official or designee may revoke the permit
of any organization that violates the provisions of this Section or any rules or regulations
promulgated pursuant to Section 5602.6(b). Notice of revocation shall be made in writing

Page 25 of 30



by the fire department to the organization. The fire code official or his designee may
reinstate a permit upon proof that the permit holder is in compliance with all provisions and
rules pertaining to this Section.

5602.1.1 Administrative Fines. In addition to any other remedy available at law, any
person or entity who possesses, uses, stores, sells and/or displays dangerous fireworks
or any person or entity who possesses, uses, sells and/or displays Safe and Sane
fireworks on or at dates, times, or locations other than those permitted by this Section are
subject to an administrative fine of not less than one-thousand dollars ($1,000.00).

5602.12 Seizure of Fireworks. The fire code official or designee shall seize, take, remove
or cause to be removed, at the expense of the owner, all stocks of fireworks offered or
exposed for sale, stored or held in violation of this Section. Such seizure shall be subject
to cost recovery in accordance with Section 109.5.

5602.13 Appeals.

(a) Any administrative citation issued for failure to comply with the provisions of this
Section can be appealed to the North Central Fire Protection District Board of Directors by
submitting a written request for an appeal hearing within 10 days from the date of the
citation. Appeals shall be mailed to "Attention: Fire Chief, North Central Fire Protection
District 15850 W. Kearney Blvd., Kerman, California 93630". If no appeal is filed within the
time prescribed, the action of the fire code official or designee shall be final.

(b)  The denial of an application for a fireworks permit shall be appealed pursuant to
5602.13(a). If no appeal is filed within the time prescribed, the action of the fire code official

or designee shall be final.

(c) A minor and the parent(s) or guardian(s) having custody and control of said minor,
are jointly and severally liable to the North Central Fire Protection District for any
administrative citation and/or penalty issued for failure to comply with the provisions of this
Section.

(d) The administrative citation penalty may become a special assessment or a lien
against the property of any person who is issued a citation for violation of the provisions of
this Section. This shall include the property of a minor who is issued a citation and/or the
property of the parent(s) or guardian(s) having custody and control of the minor or private
property owner that allows the illegal use or storage on their property.

SECTION 5604 PROHIBITION OF EXPLOSIVES.

Section 5604.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

Page 26 of 30



5604.1 Prohibition of Explosives. The possession, storage, use and handling of
explosives are prohibited within the limits established by law.

Exception: Storage and sale of small arms ammunition, small arms primers, smokeless
powder and black sporting powder in accordance with Title 19, Chapter 10, Article 12 of
the California Code of Regulations and Section 307 of the California Building Code.

FLAMMABLE AND COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS
SECTION 5704 STORAGE
SECTION 5704.3.5.1 BASEMENT STORAGE.
Section 5704.3.5.1 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

5704.3.5.1 Basement Storage. Class | liquids shall not be stored in basements. Class I
and llIA liquids shall be allowed to be stored in basements, provided that automatic fire
suppression and other fire protection are provided in accordance with Chapter 9.

LIQUIFIED PETROLEUM GASES
SECTION 6101 GENERAL
SECTION 6101.3 CONSTRUCTION DOCUMENTS.
Section 6101.3 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

6101.3 Construction Documents. Where a single container or aggregate of containers
is more than 500 gallons in water capacity, the installer shall submit construction
documents for such installation.

APPENDIX B
FIRE-FLOW REQUIREMENTS FOR BUILDINGS
SECTION B103.4 ADDITIONAL MODIFICATIONS.
Section B103.4 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

B103.4 Additional Modifications. The fire chief is authorized to make additional
modifications to fire-flow requirements for any building, or group of buildings, provided the
modifications meet the intent of this code and are supported by the water system capability
of the water purveyor. This section does not permit, and shall not be used for, waiving
provisions of this code for required fire flow.

Page 27 of 30



APPENDIX C
FIRE HYDRANT LOCATIONS AND DISTRIBUTION
SECTION C103.4 ADDITIONAL MODIFICATIONS.
Section C103.4 of the California Fire Code is amended to read:

C103.4 Additional Modifications. The Fire Chief is authorized to make additional
modifications to the number of fire hydrants, fire hydrant spacing and fire hydrant location
requirements, provided the modifications meet the intent of this code and are supported
by the water distribution system. This section does not permit, and shall not be used for,
waiving provisions of this code related to the number of fire hydrants, or fire hydrant
spacing and location requirements.

SECTION 8-103 HISTORIC BUILDINGS.
Section 8-103.3 of the California Historical Building Code (CHBC) is amended to read:

8-103.3 Liability. Prevailing law regarding immunity of building and fire officials is
unaffected by the use and enforcement of the CHBC.

8-104.4 Local Agency Fees. The North Central Fire Protection District and any local
agencies, when involved in the appeal, may also charge affected persons reasonable fees
not to exceed the cost of obtaining reviews and appeals from the Board.

8-302.1 Existing use. The specific use or character of occupancy of a qualified historical
building or property, or portion thereof, may be permitted to continue in use regardless of
any period of time in which it may have remained unoccupied or in other uses, provided
such building or property otherwise conforms to all applicable requirements of the CHBC.

8-302.2 Change in occupancy. The use or character of the occupancy of a qualified
historical building or property may be changed from or returned to its historical use or
character, provided the qualified historical building or property conforms to the
requirements applicable to the new use or character of occupancy as set forth in the CHBC
and North Central Fire Protection District Fire Code sections 903.1 through 903.3.5.1.2.
Such change in occupancy shall not mandate conformance with new construction
requirements as set forth in regular code.

Page 28 of 30



If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this ordinance is, for any reason,
held to be unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining
portions of this ordinance. The North Central Fire Protection District hereby declares that
it would have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase
thereof, regardless if any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and
phrases be declared unconstitutional.

This ordinance shall be in full force and effect after its adoption by the North Central Fire
Protection Board of Directors and ratification by the City of Kerman City Council and the
County of Fresno Board of Supervisors.

PASSED AND ADOPTED at a regular meeting of the Board of Directors of the North
Central Fire Protection District on this 23" day of January, 2020, by the following vote:

AYES: Abrahamian, Belluomini, Foglio, Nonini and Souza
NOES:

ABSENT:

ABSTENTION:

AWEMM

Board Chairperson

oard ‘Secretary

Page 29 of 30



CERTIFICATE
STATE OF CALIFORNIA )

COUNTY OF FRESNO ) SsS.
CITY OF KERMAN )

|, Amanda Souza, Board Secretary of the North Central Fire Protection District, do
certify that the foregoing Ordinance of the Board of Directors of the North Central Fire

Protection District was dully passed and adopted at a regular meeting of the Board of
Directors on January 23, 2020.

DATED: January 23, 2020

oard Secretary

Page 30 of 30



