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25-1409 Agreement No. 26-098

RETROACTIVE AMENDMENT NO. 4 TO MASTER AGREEMENT FOR PUMP AND
ELECTRIC MOTOR SERVICES
This Amendment No. 4 to Service Agreement (“Amendment No. 4”) is dated

March 3, 2026 and is between each of the contractors who are listed in Exhibit “A”,

attached hereto and incorporated herein by this reference, individually hereinafter referred to as
“Contractor” and collectively hereinafter referred to as “Contractors”, and such additional
Contractors as may, from time to time during the term of this Agreement, be added by the
County of Fresno, and the County of Fresno, a political subdivision of the State of California
(“County”).

Recitals

A. On October 19, 2021, the County and the Contractor entered into Pump and Electrical
Motor Service & Repair Master Agreement, which is County agreement number 21-431
(“Agreement”), for pump and electrical motor service and repair, including on site repairs and
replacement of water and wastewater related items to County.

B. On December 21, 2021, the County and the Contractor entered into Amendment #1 to
Master Agreement for Pump and Electrical Motor Service and Repair to add Gleim-Crown
Pump, Inc. as a contractor to provide pump and electrical motor service and repairs.

C. On May 28, 2024, the County and the Contractor entered into Amendment #2 to Master
Agreement for Pump and Electrical Motor Service and Repair to add Bogie’'s Pump Systems as
a contractor to provide pump and electrical motor service and repairs.

D. On June 6, 2025, the County and the Contractor entered into Amendment #3 to Master
Agreement for Pump and Electrical Motor Service and Repair to add Cornerstone
Environmental Contractors, Inc. as a contractor to provide pump and electrical motor service
and repairs.

E. During the first extension, which constitutes the fourth year of the Agreement, the
County experienced a substantial increase in the volume of on-site repairs of water and
wastewater related items. As a result, the existing annual expenditure limit has become

impractical given the increased demand and frequency of services.
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F. The County has identified unexpected funds from prior Agreement periods that could be
more effectively used if rolled over to subsequent years, rather than being restricted by the
current annual spending cap.

G. The County and the Contractor now desire to further amend the Agreement to remove
the annual expenditure limit thereby providing greater financial flexibility and ensuring a timely
response to service demands.

The parties therefore agree as follows:

1. Section 5 of the Agreement located at page 4, line 28, and page 5, lines 1 through 9, is
deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following:

“County agrees to pay Contractor(s) and Contractor(s) agree to receive
compensation for labor, travel time, parts, pump rigs, service trucks and
equipment utilized for County-authorized work in accordance with the rates
identified in the sub-parts Exhibit B, when services are requested by authorized
staff from the various Department divisions. The total maximum amount for the
services during the three (3) year initial and the two (2) one-year renewal periods
shall not exceed Three Million Dollars ($3,000,000). The total maximum amount
for the final year shall not exceed $700,000. It is understood that all expenses
incidental to Contractor’s performance of services under this Agreement shall be
borne by Contractor.”

2. When both parties have signed this Amendment No. 4, the Agreement, Amendment No.
1, Amendment No. 2, Amendment No. 3, and this Amendment No. 4 together constitute the
Agreement.

3. This Amendment No. 4 shall be effective retroactively to August 1, 2025.

4. The Contractor represents and warrants to the County that:

a. The Contractor is duly authorized and empowered to sign and perform its obligations

under this Amendment.
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b.

The individual signing this Amendment on behalf of the Contractor is duly authorized
to do so and his or her signature on this Amendment legally binds the Contractor to

the terms of this Amendment.

5. The parties agree that this Amendment may be executed by electronic signature as

provided in this section.

a.

An “electronic signature” means any symbol or process intended by an individual
signing this Amendment to represent their signature, including but not limited to (1) a
digital signature; (2) a faxed version of an original handwritten signature; or (3) an
electronically scanned and transmitted (for example by PDF document) version of an
original handwritten signature.

Each electronic signature affixed or attached to this Amendment (1) is deemed
equivalent to a valid original handwritten signature of the person signing this
Amendment for all purposes, including but not limited to evidentiary proof in any
administrative or judicial proceeding, and (2) has the same force and effect as the
valid original handwritten signature of that person.

The provisions of this section satisfy the requirements of Civil Code section 1633.5,
subdivision (b), in the Uniform Electronic Transaction Act (Civil Code, Division 3, Part
2, Title 2.5, beginning with section 1633.1).

Each party using a digital signature represents that it has undertaken and satisfied
the requirements of Government Code section 16.5, subdivision (a), paragraphs (1)
through (5), and agrees that each other party may rely upon that representation.
This Amendment is not conditioned upon the parties conducting the transactions
under it by electronic means and either party may sign this Amendment with an

original handwritten signature.

6. This Amendment may be signed in counterparts, each of which is an original, and all of

which together constitute this Amendment.
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7. The Agreement as previously amended and as amended by this Amendment No. 4 is
ratified and continued. All provisions of the Agreement as previously amended and not
amended by this Amendment No. 4 remain in full force and effect.

[SIGNATURE PAGE FOLLOWS]
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CORNERSTONE ENVIRONMENTAL
CONTRACTORS, INC.

Kandy L. Fowler

Randy L. Fowfer (Jan 23,2026 10:12:30 PST)
Randy L. Fowler, President

P.O. Box 5127
Concord, CA 94524

For accounting use only:

Various County Service Areas and Waterworks District:

Orgs: 9140, 9141, 9145, 9150, 9250, 9154, 9163, 9170, 9171, 9171, 9174, 9322, 9322, 9320,
9181, 9255, 9254 9323, 9324, 9325, 9212, 9301, 9244, 9246 9247 9310 9249 9357, 9358,
9360, 9351, 9361, 9362

Various Disposal Sites:
Orgs 9026 and 9020

Parks:
Org 7910

Accounts: 7205, 7220, 7295

Facility Services:
Org No.: 8935
Account No.: 7205
Fund No.: 1045
Subclass No.: 10000




Master Agreement- Pump and Motor Services

LIST OF CONTRACTORS

Exhibit A
Page 1of 1

CONTRACTOR NAME

ADDRESS

CONTRACTOR CONTACT

. Shaver Lake Construction

P.O. Box 447

Shaver Lake, CA 93644

Contact: Wendy Blair
Phone: (559) 841-3747

E-mail: wendy@shaverlakeconstruction.com

DXP Enterprises, Inc.

1122 Carrier Parkway Ave.

Bakersfield, CA 93308

Contact: Marc Sanchez
Phone: (714) 779-0911

Email: marc.sanchez@dxpe.com

Gleim-Crown Pump, Inc.

P.O. Box 12585

Fresno, CA 93778

Contact: Jason Gleim
Phone: (559) 266-0584

Email: jasong@aqleimcrownpump.com

Bogie’'s Pump Systems

4916 E Ashlan Ave.

Fresno, CA 93726

Contact: Jorge Mijangos
Phone: (559) 917-3536

Email: jorgem@bpumps.net

. Cornerstone Environmental

Contractors, Inc.

P.O. Box 5127

Concord, CA 94524

Contact: Randy L. Fowler
Phone: (925) 324-0560

Email: rfowler@cornerstoneenv.com




Master Agreement - Pump and Motor Services

DXP ENTERPRISES, INC

(714) 779-0911

marc.sanchez@dxpe.com

VALLEY DISTRICT Per Hour |MOUNTAIN DISTRICT Per Hour |WESTERN DISTRICT Per Hour
Pump Rig: Pump Rig: Pump Rig:

Service Truck - 1 man $125.00 |[Service Truck - 1 man $125.00 |[Service Truck - 1 man $125.00
Service Truck - 2 man $250.00 |Service Truck - 2 man $250.00 |Service Truck - 2 man $250.00
3 to 5 ton Service Truck: 3 to 5 ton Service Truck: 3 to 5 ton Service Truck:

1 man $165.00 |1 man $165.00 |1 man $165.00
2 man $330.00 |2 man $330.00 |2 man $330.00
10 ton Service Truck 10 ton Service Truck 10 ton Service Truck

1 man $165.00 |1 man $165.00 |1 man $165.00
2 man $330.00 |2 man $330.00 |2 man $330.00
Backhoe N/A Backhoe N/A Backhoe N/A
Total Equipment Total Equipment Total Equipment

Labor Rates: Labor Rates: Labor Rates:

In Shop Rate $125.00 |In Shop Rate $125.00 |In Shop Rate $125.00
On Site Rate $125.00 |On Site Rate $125.00 |On Site Rate $125.00
(State the increment hourly rate is (State the increment hourly rate is (State the increment hourly rate is

billed i.e. ¥4, 1/3, ¥ etc.) 1/2  |billed i.e. ¥, 1/3, % etc.) 1/2  |billed i.e. ¥, 1/3, % etc.) 1/2
Over time Rate $187.50 |Over time Rate $187.50 |Over time Rate $187.50
(State when overtime begins) after 8 hrs |(State when overtime begins) after 8 hrs |(State when overtime begins) after 8 hrs
After Hours Rate $187.50 |After Hours Rate $187.50 |After Hours Rate $187.50
(State time of day After Hours (State time of day After Hours (State time of day After Hours

begins) 5:00 PM [begins) 5:00 PM [begins) 5:00 PM
Holiday and Weekend Rate $250.00 |Holiday and Weekend Rate $250.00 |Holiday and Weekend Rate $250.00
Charge for Pick up Varies [Charge for Pick up Varies [Charge for Pick up Varies
Charge for Delivery Varies [Charge for Delivery Varies [Charge for Delivery Varies
Travel Rates Per Mile: $1.00 |Travel Rates Per Mile: $1.00 |Travel Rates Per Mile: $1.00

Exhibit B-1



Master Agreement - Pump and Motor Services

Shaver Lake Construction

(559) 841-3747

wendy@shaverlakeconstruction.com

VALLEY DISTRICT: Per Hour |MOUNTAIN DISTRICT Per Hour |WESTERN DISTRICT Per Hour
Pump Rig: Pump Rig: Pump Rig:

Service Truck - 1 man No Bid |Service Truck - 1 man $98.00 [Service Truck -1 man No Bid
Service Truck - 2 man No Bid |Service Truck - 2 man $196.00 [Service Truck -2 man No Bid
3 to 5 ton Service Truck: 3 to 5 ton Service Truck: 3 to 5 ton Service Truck:

1 man No Bid |1 man $148.00 |1 man No Bid
2 man No Bid |2 man $246.00 |2 man No Bid
10 ton Service Truck 10 ton Service Truck 10 ton Service Truck

1 man No Bid |1 man $163.00 |1 man No Bid
2 man No Bid |2 man $261.00 |2 man No Bid
Backhoe No Bid [Backhoe $148.00 |[Backhoe No Bid
Total Equipment Total Equipment Total Equipment

Labor Rates: Labor Rates: Labor Rates:

In Shop Rate No Bid |In Shop Rate N/A In Shop Rate No Bid
On Site Rate No Bid |On Site Rate $98.00 |On Site Rate No Bid
(State the increment hourly rate is (State the increment hourly rate is (State the increment hourly rate is

billed i.e. %, 1/3, % etc.) billed i.e. %, 1/3, % etc.) 1/2 billed i.e. 4, 1/3, ¥; etc.)

Over time Rate No Bid |Over time Rate $147.00 [Over time Rate No Bid
(State when overtime begins) (State when overtime begins) after 8 hrs |(State when overtime begins)

After Hours Rate No Bid |After Hours Rate $147.00 |After Hours Rate No Bid
(State time of day After Hours (State time of day After Hours (State time of day After Hours

begins) begins) after 8 hrs |begins)

Holiday and Weekend Rate No Bid |Holiday and Weekend Rate $147.00 |Holiday and Weekend Rate No Bid
Charge for Pick up No Bid |Charge for Pick up None Charge for Pick up No Bid
Charge for Delivery No Bid |Charge for Delivery None Charge for Delivery No Bid
Travel Rates Per Mile: No Bid |Travel Rates Per Mile: None Travel Rates Per Mile: No Bid




Master Agreement - Pump and Motor Services

Exhibit B-3

Gleim Crown Pump, Inc.

(559) 266-0584
jasong@gleimcrownpump.com

GROUP | GROUP Il
VALLEY DISTRICT: Per Hour JMOUNTAIN DISTRICT Per Hour |WESTERN DISTRICT Per Hour Per Hour
Pump Rig: Pump Rig: Pump Rig: Pump Rig:
Service Truck - 1 man $105.00 |[Service Truck - 1 man $105.00 |[Service Truck - 1 man $105.00 |[Service Truck - 1 man $105.00
Service Truck - 2 man $160.00 |Service Truck - 2 man $160.00 |Service Truck - 2 man $160.00 |Service Truck - 2 man $160.00
3 to 5 ton Service Truck: 3 to 5 ton Service Truck: 3 to 5 ton Service Truck: 3 to 5 ton Service Truck:
1 man $175.00 |1 man $175.00 |1 man $175.00 |1 man $175.00
2 man $225.00 |2 man $225.00 |2 man $225.00 |2 man $225.00
10 ton Service Truck 10 ton Service Truck 10 ton Service Truck 10 ton Service Truck
1 man $200.00 |1 man $200.00 |1 man $200.00 |1 man $200.00
2 man $225.00 |2 man $225.00 |2 man $225.00 |2 man $225.00
Backhoe N/A Backhoe N/A Backhoe N/A Backhoe N/A
Total Equipment Total Equipment Total Equipment Total Equipment
Labor Rates: Labor Rates: Labor Rates: Labor Rates:
In Shop Rate $125.00 |In Shop Rate $125.00 |In Shop Rate $125.00 |In Shop Rate $125.00
On Site Rate $125.00 |On Site Rate $125.00 |On Site Rate No Bid ]|On Site Rate $125.00
(State the increment hourly (State the increment hourly (State the increment hourly (State the increment hourly
rate is billed i.e. ¥4, 1/3, V2 rate is billed i.e. ¥4, 1/3, V2 rate is billed i.e. ¥4, 1/3, V2 rate is billed i.e. ¥4, 1/3, V2
etc.) 1/4  Jetc)) 1/4  |etc)) 1/4  |etc)) 1/4
Over time Rate $157.50 |Over time Rate $157.50 |Over time Rate $157.50 |Over time Rate $187.50
(State when overtime (State when overtime (State when overtime (State when overtime
begins) after 8 hrs |begins) after 8 hrs |begins) after 8 hrs |begins) after 8 hrs
After Hours Rate $157.50 |After Hours Rate $157.50 |After Hours Rate $157.50 |After Hours Rate $157.50
(State time of day After (State time of day After (State time of day After (State time of day After
Hours begins) 5:00 PM [Hours begins) 5:00 PM [Hours begins) 5:00 PM [Hours begins) 5:00 PM
Holiday and Weekend Rate 1.5 times Holiday and Weekend Rate 1.5 times Holiday and Weekend Rate No Bid Holiday and Weekend Rate $157.50
Charge for Pick up $100.00 |Charge for Pick up $100.00 |Charge for Pick up $100.00 |Charge for Pick up $100.00
Charge for Delivery $100.00 |Charge for Delivery $100.00 |Charge for Delivery $100.00 |Charge for Delivery $100.00
Travel Rates Per Mile: None |Travel Rates Per Mile: None |Travel Rates Per Mile: None |Travel Rates Per Mile: None



Lorenia Torres Rangel
Underline


Master Agreement - Pump and Motor Services

Exhibit B-4

Bogie's Pump Systems
(559) 291-9701
jorgem@bpumps.net

GROUP | GROUP Il
VALLEY DISTRICT: Per Hour JMOUNTAIN DISTRICT Per Hour |WESTERN DISTRICT Per Hour Per Hour
Pump Rig: Pump Rig: Pump Rig: Pump Rig:
Service Truck - 1 man $235.00 |Service Truck - 1 man $235.00 |Service Truck - 1 man $235.00 |Service Truck - 1 man $235.00
Service Truck - 2 man $390.00 |Service Truck - 2 man $390.00 |[Service Truck - 2 man $390.00 |[Service Truck - 2 man $390.00
3 to 5 ton Service Truck: 3 to 5 ton Service Truck: 3 to 5 ton Service Truck: 3 to 5 ton Service Truck:
1 man N/A 1 man N/A 1 man N/A 1 man N/A
2 man N/A 2 man N/A 2 man N/A 2 man N/A
10 ton Service Truck 10 ton Service Truck 10 ton Service Truck 10 ton Service Truck
1 man N/A 1 man N/A 1 man N/A 1 man N/A
2 man N/A 2 man N/A 2 man N/A 2 man N/A
Backhoe N/A Backhoe N/A Backhoe N/A Backhoe N/A
Total Equipment Total Equipment Total Equipment Total Equipment
Labor Rates: Labor Rates: Labor Rates: Labor Rates:
In Shop Rate $150.00 |In Shop Rate N/A In Shop Rate N/A In Shop Rate N/A
On Site Rate $180.00 |On Site Rate $180.00 |On Site Rate $180.00 |On Site Rate $180.00
(State the increment hourly (State the increment hourly (State the increment hourly (State the increment hourly
rate is billed i.e. ¥4, 1/3, V2 rate is billed i.e. V4, 1/3, Y2 rate is billed i.e. V4, 1/3, Y2 rate is billed i.e. V4, 1/3, Y2
etc.) 1/2 etc.) 1/2  Jetc) 1/2  Jetc) 1/2
Over time Rate $270.00 |Over time Rate $270.00 |Over time Rate $270.00 |Over time Rate $270.00
(State when overtime (State when overtime (State when overtime (State when overtime
begins) after 8 hrs |begins) after 8 hrs |begins) after 8 hrs |begins) after 8 hrs
After Hours Rate $360.00 |After Hours Rate $360.00 |After Hours Rate $360.00 |After Hours Rate $360.00
(State time of day After (State time of day After (State time of day After (State time of day After
Hours begins) 9:00 PM  |Hours begins) 8:00 PM |Hours begins) 8:00 PM |Hours begins) 9:00 PM
Holiday and Weekend Rate $450.00 Holiday and Weekend Rate $450.00 Holiday and Weekend Rate $450.00 Holiday and Weekend Rate $450.00
Charge for Pick up $80.00 |Charge for Pick up $160.00 |Charge for Pick up $100.00 |Charge for Pick up $80.00
Charge for Delivery $80.00 |Charge for Delivery $160.00 |Charge for Delivery $100.00 |Charge for Delivery $80.00
Travel Rates Per Mile: None Travel Rates Per Mile: Travel Rates Per Mile: Travel Rates Per Mile:
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